7o

 The Mizoram Gazette
. EXTRA ORDINARY
. E@:Ma@.@h@@:ﬁmy;mmm@jﬁw

{ . | .
REGN. NO. NE—313 (M2) -

:TF’r'ida)"’, 13. 6. .2(1(.)3,:".'ijajstl°.a 23,SE ' 1925, Issue No. 123

—

[Vol. XXXII Aizawl,

NOTIFICATION = .. .

No. A. 26020/1/93-DCA, the 9th June, 203
the Sixth Schedule to the Constitution of India, the following Rules of Chakma
Autonomous District Council which received the approval of the Governor of
Mizoram is heréby published for General information.

In pﬁrsuz.mc":e of paragraph 11 of

I. THE CHAKMA AUTONOMOUS DISTRICT COUNCIL .
" (Salaries and Allowances of Chairman and »D'y.f.Cbairman) ’
Rules, 2003 (vide Governor of Mizoram’s approval dt. 20.5.2003) - &

Vi

- P. Chakraborty,
Secretary .to the Govt:.of Mizoram,
District Council Affairs Deptt. ...

' S , . i 1
BRI ‘ 4 T i

THE CHAKMA AUTONOMOUS ' DISTRICT  COUNCIL (SALARIES AND
'ALLOWANCES OF CHAIRMAN AND DEPUTY CHAIRMAN) RULES, 2003.

RULES

To provide for the salaries .and. allowances of the - Chairman and
the Deputy Chairman District Council,, o '

Be it_cnac'tc‘d‘bzy the Chqkma Aul_q'nmﬁlqus; Distr’ict‘. in the Fifty Se- -
- cond yecar of: the Republic of India as follows ;-

short. Title 1. (]), These Rules ﬁmy be called the :Clidkina ‘Aufonomous Dis-

aand com- trict (Salaries and Allowances of the Chairman and the Deputy
mencemont. Chairman) Rules, 2003.

@ Scanned with OKEN Scanner



FEx-123/2003 2

(2) 1 shall b deompd fo huve como into fores with offect frgy,
the 2ded May, 2000 ‘

Delinitions 2, In these Ruley, unldgs Uhe contoxt otherwise roquires-

() “Chajrmap!’, means the Chafrf df the - Chitkma: Autono-
moin DI Codbieil; | o

(1) “Deptity Clndrmgn” - moand e Poputy - Chairmun of the
Chakma Autonomoud iatrict ' Cotuieil;

(¢) “*Dibtrict Conneil” n’u[nnﬁ (o 1lstelet ottt of the Chalkmy
1\1}1()n1()1\\t>1|3 District (,‘f‘ulnl‘lvil;

'
(d) “Pamily” in relafion to tha Chairman and the deputy. Chajr-
man minng (hd wile residing with hini and the legitimate child-
renand step children wholly depeadent on him and  whero tho
lsband has more than one” wifv, only one wile shall be inclu-
ded in his family; 159

(¢) “Government” means the Government o' Mizoram; y

() “He" and ity grammaticdl Yatidtion stdnd' for both i aigd'
woman; b ‘ =

' , i ' it
(#) “Travelling Allowances” means the gllowgnees  granted (o
the chafbmah nnd the Ddpuly Chdemah  undd’ these Rutles to
cover (he expenses which he incurs in - travelling in the interest
of publiu sorvices, -

Wt ) ( L S— A,
(h) “Schedule” means the Schedule appended to this Rale;

Suluries 3. There shipll be paid to the Chairman and the Deputy Chairman

ol Chairman a'suldry of teh thousand fupees ench per mensen.

and Deputy v N '

Chairman v

There shall be puid to the Chairman and the Doputy Chairman

sumptuary 4. o sumptuacy allowances of rupees fone  thousand five hundred .

Allowances, —cach pet hbihden, Funily rgllow‘hnue:j of Hlipegs fotr  thousail

and oher live hundbed each pér nthsem fud (! clmr'n".hnmcn|. allowantds

Allowances. ol four thousmd rupeed” and  three  thousand  five huadeed
rupees respectively, ‘

Residence 50 The Chairmiti and the Depaty Chiieimbt dhitll be entltled without
and o any paymonto'the sé dnd ainténaficé ol ' fuénishod residence
furnishing of  throughout their term of oflice and for period of 15 days
esidence. - immed litoly: Weredf(és and —so oy ag such résidence is not
provided heshall be  ¢lititled (o a ¥esidonts for which rental

churges shall be not less thyn  three  thousand live hundred ©f,

diensent ‘m\u thotid sl bo' 1'121(1{:',‘ avdilable o }‘,uh\-‘l,[‘ Ry, 40,00 )/b,

8 PUA 3y g bty ey el

vt

@ Scanned with OKEN Scanner



3 * Ex-123/2003

(Rupees forty thousand) ortly: for furnishing residence for the
first year and Rs. 5,000/- (Rupees five thousand) only for the subs
sequent year. ) - '

Explanation:-

“Malntenance” in relation to a residence includes :-
(i) Provision of free electricity and free water supply;
(ii) provision for free Telephoné calls, and

(iii) payment of local rates and taXes',.

Coveyance 0. The Chairman and the Deputy Chairman shall be entitled to
4 lowances free use of motor vzhicle, the entire cost of maintenance and
and use of  propulsion along with the services of chauffeut which shall ‘be

motor borne by the District Council. -
vehicle.

Travelling 7. Subject to the provision of the Schedule the Chairman and the
and Daily  Deputy Chairman shall be enfifled to G-

ajlowances.  (a) traVelling allowances for the transport of personal effect of
T bimself aind his, family :- '

(1) in respect of journey to Kamalanagar from bis usual place of

residence for the purpose of assuming office and demitting office.

(b) travelling and daily allowances in respect of tour undertaken

by him in the discliaige of his official duties whether by laad or

. by air. : : ‘

Medical 8. The Chairman and the Deputy Chairman and the members of
facilities. their family shall be éntitled free of charge to accommodation
+in hospital, Nursing Homes and Clinics recognised by the District
Council and also to medical treatment, conSultation- fees sind diet
charges with one medical attendaat in case he is admitted to 4-

Hospital. :

Chairman 9. No persons in  receipt of a salary or allowances under this
and Deputy  Rule shall be. entitled  to receive “any sum out of the funds
Chairman ‘provided by the District Council by way of salary and allowan-
mot to draw  ces in respect of their membership of the District Council.

of : '

Allowances

as member

ol District

Couneil, "

Notilication 10. The date*6n ‘which any person become, or ceased to be, a
respecting Chairman or Deputy Chairman shal{ be published in the Mi-
clection of zoram Gazette and any such notification shall be conclusive
Chairman cvidence. of the fact that he becomes, or ceased to be Chairman

and Deputy ' or Deputy Chairman on that date [or the purpose of this Rule.
Chairfiian to T - . ' .

¢ concly- : . o v Bes T
sve eviddgice P . Bl W, bR
thereof, Th ke " '

@ Scanned with OKEN Scanner



Ex123/2003 4 '

Discre- 11. The Chairmezn shall be provided every yez7 "“l 'thcflil],dg?‘tl 5.
tionaty - - .discretionary fund of the same amount with {mt 0 'ic (“,u’-r
Fund.” Executive Member und the Deputy Chalrman  cqual 1o the

amount provided for the Executive Member.

Houschold 12. The Chairman 2nd the Depuiy Chairmzn shall b?, n:l?tsllc;j 10

Staff. . Grade-1V staffs of three and two numbers respectively of his
choice as household staffs on a fixed pay of rupees three thouy-
sand per mensem and the appointment of  them shall  be co-
terminus without yearly increment.

Repeal and 13.7(1) The Chakma Autonomous District Council ,f"“)"'””“f' and

saving. Allowances of Chief Executive Member, Erccutive ’V”‘{’ﬂb"’v
Chairman and Deputy Chairman) Rules, 1983 and all subse-
quent amendments thereof are liereby repealed.

* (2) Notwithstanding such repeal znything done or any action
taken under the Rules so repealed shall, in so far as it is not
inconsistent with the provision of this Rule, be deemed to have
been done or taken under this Rules.

SCHEDULE
(sce Rule 7)

Travelling 1. “hen travelling on duty by Railwav or by Roud, or by Steamer ot
on duty. by Air tie Chairman and the Depu'y Chairman <hall be  entitled 1o
' “reimburse the actual fare of journey including incidental charges and
daily allowances of rupees 250/~ within Mizoram and rupees 300)/-

out side Mizoram.

s
L

Travelling 2. In respect of Journey to Kamalanagar from his usual place of
Allowances  residence for assuming of from Kamalanagar to his usual place of
on journcy residence on demitting office, the Chairman and the Deputy Chair-
for assuming man is entitled to travelling allowances towards the ~ost of trans-
and demit- porting himself and the members of his family and families effects.
ting of Ofiice. - ' ’

Travelling 3. (1) The Chairman and the Deputy  Chairman

) . : may in public
by Air. Interest, perform journey on tour by Air in tra

nsport services.

(2) In the cancellation of a Journey due to official reason, the
Chairman and the Deputy Chairman shall pe entitled 10 be
reimbursed by the District Council any deduction made by the

Alr transport’ services when refund;
' é nding the fare on  account of
cancellation of the Air passage. i

(3) The Chairman and the Deputy  Chairman who docs not
utilisz the free transport serviee between the 4 iy DOOKin c::mrf:
and the Airport may zlso TeCover in respect of:journt;"glo and
from the Airport actua] travelling expenses of road ‘!lc 'cd as’
as for journey on duty by road which ever is less, Caae

@ Scanned with OKEN Scanner



5 Ex -123/2003

* pccomoda= 4. ‘Where no Government accomodation is available the Chairman

tjon. and the Deputy Chairman on official duty shall be entitled to

reimbursement of accomodation charge of double. toom in a Three
Star Hofel subject to production actual payment receipt.

‘ z ' . s | ‘ ~ oy
Advance. 5. ,(tl) . The Chaitman and ‘the Deputy Chairman shall be entitled
0= | _

‘a) An advance of travelling allowances fowards the cost of
transporting themselves and the member of their families and
their families effect:- : ' ‘ ‘

(1) 1In respect of the journcy to Kamalanagar from their usual
place of residence (or assuming oflice; and

(i) In respect of the journey from Kamalanagar to their usual
place” of residence outside of Kamalanagar on relinquishing

office; and

(b) An advance travelling and daily allowances in respect of
the tour undertaken by them in the = discharge of their ollicial
duties whether by land, sea or Air.

(2) These advances will be adjusted in the first travelling
allowance bill submitted thereafter.

&
STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

The balaries and allowances of Chairman and Deputy Chairman under the pro-
vision of the Chakma Aatdiiomous District Council (Salaries and Allowances of
Chief’ Exccutive Member, Execiitive Members, Chairman and Deputy Chairman)
Rules, 1983 are considered inadequate to meet the present demand in view of
the rapid increase of the price index. It is therefore felt necessary to increase
the salaries, allowances and other facilities and privileges of the Chairman and
the Deputy Chairman of the District Council.

v

This bill seeks to repeal the aforesaid Rules.
Hence the bill.

Sd/- RASIK. MOHAN CHAKMA, i
Chiel' Executive Member.

Chakma Autonomous District Council,

Kamalanagar. :

@ Scanned with OKEN Scanner



Ex—123/20¢

CERTIFICATE OF AUTHENTICATION

Certified that the above Official Bill 'was p

2
D

laced by the Chairman, Chakma
ion ‘as provided by Rule 94 of the

Autonomous District -Council for reconsideration ) ;
itution and 'Conduct of Businegs

Mizoram Autonomous District Councils ‘(Constl
of the District Councils) Rules, 1974. - After t
mously passed in the First sitting of the
Chakma Autonomous District Council he
signed on this Eighteenth day of August Two Thousand- One

horough discussion it was unani.
Monsoon Session, 2001 of the Sixtp

Id on 27/7/2001 and in authentication
Anno Domini.

(ADIKANTA TONGCHONGYA)

Chairman,

Chakma Autonomous District Council,

Kamalanagar.

Publiched & Issued by the Controller, Printing & Stationory, Mizoram
Printed at the Mizoram Govermment Press, Aizawl C— 700

- : ot e

@ Scanned with OKEN Scanner



The Mizoram Gazette
EXTRA ORDINARY

Published by Authority

RNINo. 27009/1973 Postal Regn. No. NE-313(MZ) 2006-2008

_ VOL-XLII Aizawl, Friday 22.8.2014 Sravana 31, S.E. 1936, IssueNo.425

NOTIFICATION

No.A. 26020/1/2009-DCA, the 4" August, 2014, In pursuance of paragraph 11 of the Sixth
Schedule to the Constitution of India, the Amendment Rules passed by the Chakma Autonomous District
Council which received approval of His Excellency the Governor of Mizoram on 21.3.2014 and vetted by
Finanlce Department vide 1.D. No. FIN(E) 313/2014 dt. 28.7.2014 i hereby published for general information,
namely :-

“THE CHAKMA AUTONOMOUS DISTRICT COUNCIL (SALARIES & ALLOWANCES
OF CHIEF EXECUTIVE MEMBER/EXECUTIVE MEMBER/ADVISER TO CHIEF
EXECUTIVE MEMBER/CHAIRMAN/DEPUTY CHAIRMAN/VICE CHAIRMAN,
(PLANNING)/OPPOSITION LEADER/MEMBER AND PENSION OF MEMBER)
(AMENDMENT) RULES, 2012”.

P. Singthanga,
Secretary to the Govt. of Mizoram,
District Council Affairs Department.

@ Scanned with OKEN Scanner



Pa-0V0N4 .3
| CHAR T . DISTRICT COUNCIL (SALARIES AND
THE CHAKMA AUTONOMOUS DISTRICT COUNCGIE (075
\LLOWANCES OF CHIEF EXECUTIVE MEMBER AND EXECUTIVE MEMBERS
(AMENDMENT RULES) 2012.

A
RULES

ncil (Salaries and Allowances of Chief Executiye

turther 10 amend the Chakma Autonomous District Cou Al
rincipal Rules).

M ]
NMember and Executive Members) Rules, 2003 (hereinafter referred to as the F

Be it enacted by the Chakma Autonomous District Council in the Sixty-Third Year of Republic o
Indw ax follows:- .
These rules may be called the Chakma Autonomous District Counci]
(Salarics and Allowances of the Chief Executive Member and Executive

Members etc. (Amendment) Rules, 201.2. -
(2)  They shall come into force with retrospective effect from 1* April 2012,

Short title and l. (1)
commencement

Amendment of 2. After Rule 2 (g) of the principal Rules, the following definition shall be
Rule 2. inserted, namely, )

(h)  “Adviser to Chicf Executive Member™ means a person who is appointed
{0 assist the Chief Executive Member of the Chakma Autonomous
District Council in certain functions. .

(i)  “Opposition Leader” means the leader of the opposition members
having one-third of the elected members from a single recognised or
registered Political Party.

() “Vice-Chairman (Planning)” means a person who is appointed as
Vice Chairman (Planning) of the Chakma Autonomous District Council”.

Amendment of 3. InRule 3 of the Principal Rules:-
Rule 3. (1) For the words “Chief Executive Member and Executive Members”,

the words and brackets “Chief Executive Member, Executive Members,
Opposition Leader, Adviser to Chief Executive Member and Vice-
Chairman (Planning)” shall be substituted.

Amendment of 4. i)  Rule4ofthePrincipal Rules shall be substituted as follows, namely,
“4 (1) There shall be paid to the Chief Executive Member a sumptuary
allowances of Rs. 7,000/ Rupees seven thousand) only and to Executive
Members, Opposition Leader, Adviser to Chief Executive Member
and Vice-Chairman (Planning) Rs. 6,000/-(Rupees six thousand) only
cach per mensem.

(2) There shall be paid to the Chief Executive Member a family
allowances of Rs. 6,000/-(Rupees six thousand) only and to Executive
Members, Opposition Leader, Adviser to Chief Executive Member
and Vice-Chairman (Planning) Rs. 4,000/-(Rupees four

only each per mensem. .
(3) There shall be paid to the Chief Executive Member an entertainment
allowances of Rs. 4,000/-(Rupees four thousand) only and to Executive
Members, Opposition Leader, Adviser to Chief Executive Member
and Vice-Chairman (Planning) Rs. 3,000/-(Rupees three

only each per mensem.

Rule 4.

-

G Scanned with OKEN Scanner



Amendment ‘of -

en 5.
Rule 5. "

i Explanation:
Amendment of 6.
Rule 6.~
Amendment of 7.
Rule 7.

Amendment of | 8.
Rule 8.
Amendment of 9.
Rule 10.
Amendment of 10.
Rule 11.
Amendment of 11.

Rule 12.

.o -3- Ex-425/2014
Rule 5 of the Principal Rules shall be substituted as follows, namely:-

“S. The Chief Executive Member, Executive Members, Opposition
Leader, Adviser to Chief Executive Member and Vice-Chairman (Planning)”
shall_ be entitled without any payment to the use and maintenance of a
furnished residence throughout their terms of office and for a period of
fifteen days immediately thereafter. '

Provided that they shall be entitled to residence for which rental charge
shall not be more than Rs. 5,000/-(Rupees five thousand) only per mensem
and there shall be made available a sum of Rs. 50,000/~ (Rupees fifty thousand)
only for furnishing residence in the first year and Rs. 25,000/- (Rupees
twenty five thousand) only annually for the subsequent years.

Provided further that the payment rate for electricity, calls of telephone,

free water supply, local rates and taxes shall be fixed by the Chief Executive
Member, :

“Maintenance” in relation to residence includes,

(i)  Provision of electricity and free water supply.
() Provision of free telephone calls, and

(iii)  Provision of local rates and taxes”.

InRule 6 of the Principal Rules, after the words “the Executive Members,”
the words and brackets “Opposition Leader, Adviser to Chief Executive
Member and Vice-Chairman (Planning)” shall be inserted.

In-Rule 7 of the Principal Rul&s,' after the words “the Executive Members”,
the words and brackets “Opposition Leaders, Adviser to Chief Executive
Member and Vice-Chairman (Planning)” shall be inserted.

Rule 8 of the Principal Rules, after the words “the Executive Members”,
the words and brackets “Opposition Leaders, Adviser to Chief Executive

" Member and Vice-Chairman (Planning)” shall be inserted and the words

“recognised by the District Council” shall be substituted by “in any Hospitals,
Nursing Homes and Clinics”.

InRule 10 of the Principal Rules, after the words “or Executive Members”,
the words and brackets “or Opposition Leader, or Adviser to Chief Executive
Member or Vice-Chairman (Planning)” shall be inserted.

InRule 11 of the Principal Rules, after the words “the Chief Executive Member”,
the words and brackets “the Executive Members, Adviser to Chief Executive
Member or Vice-Chairman (Planning)” shall be inserted.

Rule 12 of the Principal Rules shall be substituted as follows, namely;
“12. The Chief Executive Member shall be entitled to receive the
services of 3 (three) Grade IV staff and the Executive Members, Opposition
Leader, Adviser to Chief Executive Member and Vice-Chairman (Planning)”
shall be entitled to receive the services of 2 (two) Grade IV staff each
according to their own choice. The rate of wages of grade IV staff shall be
revisable from time to time and their appointment shall be co-terminus”.

@ Scanned with OKEN Scanner



Ex-425/2014 -4 -

inci figures “Rs. 250/-"and “Rs, 30g/»

Amendment of 12.  In Schedule of the Principal Rula;‘,‘ for the figu 3000,
Schedule the figures, brackets and words “Rs. 5 0(’)’/-(Rupee:s five hundred) only”

“Rs. 750/-(Rupees seven hundred) only” respectively shall be substituteq.

THE CHAKMA AUTONOMOUS DISTRICT COUNCIL (SALARIES AND
ALLOWANCES OF CHAIRMAN AND DEPUTY CHAIRMAN (AMENDMENT
RULES) 2012.
A =
RULES .

further {o amend the Chakma Autonomous District Council (Salaries and Allowances of Chairman ang
Deputy Chairman) Rules, 2003 (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Rules).

Be it enacted by the Chakma Autonomous District Council in the Sixty-Third Year of Republic of
India as follows:

Short title and 1. (1) Theserules may be called the Chakma Autonomous District Council
commencement (Salaries and Allowances of Chairman and Deputy Chairman (Amendment)
Rules, 2012. v aamlime s
(2)  They shall come into force with retrospective effect from 1% April 2012, * A
Amendment of 2. In Rule 3 of the Principal Rules, for the words “ten thousand”, the words
Rule 3. “forty thousand” shall be substituted. , |
|
Amendment of 3. Rule 4 of the Principal Rules shall be substituted as follows, namely; i c
Rule 4. “4. There shall be paid to the Chairman and the Deputy Chairmana | °©
sumptuary allowances of Rs. 6,000/-(Rupees six thousand) only each per €
mensem, family allowances of Rs. 5,000/-(Rupees five thousand) only in |
respect of Chairman per mensem and Rs. 4,000/-(Rupees four thousand | y

thousand) only in respect of Deputy Chairman per mensem, and entertainment I
allowances of Rs. 4,000/-(Rupees four thousand) only in respect of Chairman
and Rs. 3,000/-(Rupees three thousand) only in respect of Deputy Chairman /

per mensem. ' 1
Amendment of 4. InRule 5 of the Principal Rules, {H y
Rule 5. (i)  For the words “three thousand five hundred rupees”, the figures, ‘| |

words and brackets “Rs. 5,000/-(Rupees five thousand) only shall
be substituted. ' R
(i)~ For the figures, brackets and words “Rs. 40,000/ (Rupees forty’
thousand)”, the figures, brackets and words “Rs. 50,000/-(Rupees
fifty thousand)” shall be substituted. R
(iii)  For the figures, brackets and words “Rs, 5000/-(Rupees five thousand)”, ]
the figures, brackets and words Rs. 25,000/-(Rupees twenty five'
thousand) shall be substituted. WA )
(iv)  Provision to this Rule shall be inserted as follows, namely: 44 !
“ Provided that payment rate for electricity, calls of telephone,
free water supply and local rates and taxes shall be fixed by the
Chairman. However, such fixation shall be in conformity with the
Executive Committee”, '

@ Scanned with OKEN Scanner



‘.\mcndmcnt of
Rulc 12.

- amendment of
Schedule

.5- Ex-425/2014

Rule 12 of the Principal Rules shall be substituted as follows, namely,

“5. The Chairman shall be entitled to the services of 3 (three) Grade IV
staff and the Deputy Chairman shall be entitled to receive the services of
2 (two) Grade 1V staff each according to their own choice. Wages shall be
paid as un-skilled labour. The rate of wages of Grade [V staff shall be
revisable from time to time and their appointment shall be co-terminus”.

In Schedule of the Principal Rules,

(i) for the figures “Rs. 250/-" the figures, brackets and words “Rs. 500/-
(Rupees five hundred) only” shall be substituted.

(i)  for the figures “Rs. 300/-", the figures, brackets and words

“Rs. 750/-(Rupees seven hundred fifty) only” shall be substituted.

THE CHAKMA AUTONOMOUS DISTRICT COUNCIL
(SALARIES, ALLOWANCES AND PENSION OF MEMBERS)

(AMENDMENT ) RULES, 2012

A
RULES

further to amend the Chakma Autonomous District Council (Salaries, Allowances and pension of
Members) Rules, 2003 (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Rules).

Be it enacted by the Chakma Autonomous District Council in the sixty third year of the Republic of

India as follows:-
$
] Short title and
commencement
1 Amendment of

Rule 2.

} Amendment of
Rule 3.

e o e

Amendment of
Rule 5.

Amendment of
Rule 6.

e 2 e N

= ™

Amendment of
Rule 7.

1.

(1) These rules may be called the Chakma Autonomous District Council
(Salaries Allowances and Pension of Members) (Amendment) Rules, 2012.
(2)  They shall come into force with retrospective effect from Ist April 2012.

In Rule 2 (g) of the Principal Rules, after the words “Executive Member”,
the words “Opposition Leader”, shall be inserted.

In Rule 3 of the Principal Rules, for the words *“‘ten thousand rupees”, the
words “forty thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

Rule 5 of the Principal Rules shall be substituted es follows, namely:-

5. Amember shall be paid a constituency allowances of Rs. 3000/- (Rupees
three thousand) only per mensem, family allowances of Rs. 3000/- (Rupees
three thousand) only per mensem and entertainment allowances of
Rs. 1500/- (Rupees one thousand five hundred) only per mensem,

Rule 6 of the Principal Rules, for the figures “Rs.2,500/-", the figures,
brackets and after the words “Rs. 4,000/- (Rupees four thousand) only
shall be substituted.

Rule 7 of the Principal Rules shall be substituted as follows, namely:-
“7. A member who occupies own house shall be entitled to receive a sum
of Rs. 30,000/- (Rupees thirty thousand ) only in the first year for furnishing

and Rs. 15,000/- (Rupees fifteen thousand ) only annually for the subsequent
years of the term:

@ Scanned with OKEN Scanner



Ex-425/2014

Amendment of
Rule 8.

Amendment of
Rule 9.

3

Amendment of
Rule 12.

Amendment of
Rule 13.

Amendment of
Rule 14.

10.

11.

-6-

i ici lIs of telephone, free
Provided that payment rate for electricity, ca hone,
water supply and local rates or taxes shall be fixed by the Chairman from

time to time”.

all be substituted as follows, namely:-

¢ service of one Grade-IV staff as personal
Attendant according to his own choice and his wages shall be paid as un-
skilled labour per mensem. The rate of wages of Grade -IV staﬂ: shall be
revisable from time to time and the appointment shall be co-terminus”,

Rule 8 of the Principal Rules sh
«g. A member shall be entitled to tI

Rule 9 of the Principal Rules, for the words  two

hundred fifty rupees”, the figures, brackets and words “Rs. 500/-
hall be substituted. .

(Rupees five hundred) only” s : '
2) Insub rule (3) of Rule 9 of the Principal Rules, for the figures

«Rs. 200/- ¢, the figures, brackets and words, “Rs. 750/- (Rupees
seven hundred fifty) only” shall be substituted.

(1) Insubrule(1)of

Sub-rule (2) of Rule 12 of the Principal Rules shall be substituted as follows,

namely:-
“(2) (a) There shall be paid Rs. 20,000/ (Rupees twenty thousand ) only

per mensem to a member who had been elected /nominated once
for 5(five) year or for any period shorter than 5(five) years.

(b) There shall be paid Rs. 22,000/- (Rupees twenty two thousand)
only per mensem to a member who had been elected for three
terms or more before the commencement of these rules.

(c) Where any person has been re-elected after the commencement
of these rules for another term, whether he has completed the
term or not, he shall be entitled to an additional pension of Rs. 3,000/-

(Rupees three thousand) only per mensem.
(d) The pension shall be increased at the rate of 5% (five) percent

simple interest annually”.

In Rule 13 of the Principal Rules, for the words “one lakh rupees” the
words “five lakhs rupees” shall be substituted. i

(1) Insubrule(1)of Rule 14 of the Principal Rules, for the word “ two
thousand five hundred rupees”, the word “ ten thousand rupees”
shall be substituted.

(2) In proviso to Rule 14 of the Principal Rules, for the word, * thiss
act”, the word, “these rules” shall be substituted.

Published and Issued by Controller, Printing & Stationery De .
! partment, Govemn
Printed at the Mizoram Government Press, AIzawI.LCl150 ment of Mizoram

e

@ Scanned with OKEN Scanner

-



